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OSHA PAINTS PRICE
GROUP 1 |16 o0z. cans (12 0z. Net wt.) TOTAL
48 ea. UNIT
Safety Orange PRICE 4.69 3.89
1. Krylon Part #K02410, Lawson No. 14560 TOTAL 225.12 186.72 NO BID
172 ea. UNIT
Safety Red PRICE 4.69 3.89
2. Krylon Part #K02116, Lawson No. 14552 TOTAL 806.68 669.08 NO BID
650 ea. UNIT
Safety Yellow PRICE 4.69 3.89
3. Krylon Part #K01813, Lawson No. 14554 TOTAL 3,048.50 2,528.50 NO BID
SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1 TOTAL 4,080.30 3,384.30 NO BID
Price List Catalog Number 2019
Discount Off Price List (%) 20%
Multiplier for Discount .80
Effective Date of Price List 1/1/19
GROUP 1la|INVERTED MARKING PAINT
Water-Based 20 0z. cans (17 0z net wt.)
4,500 ea. UNIT
INVERTED WHTE KRYLON PRICE 2.43 3.37
1. Part #503901, Lawson No. 14546 TOTAL 10,935.00 15,165.00 NO BID
10,000 ea. UNIT
Fluorescent Caution Blue PRICE 243 3.37
2. Krylon Part #503620, Lawson No. 14547 TOTAL 24,300.00 33,700.00 NO BID
6,500 ea. UNIT
Fluorescent Safety Green PRICE 2.43 3.37
3. Krylon Part #503630, Lawson No. 14548 TOTAL 15,795.00 21,905.00 NO BID
300 ea. UNIT
Fluorescent Purple PRICE 2.43 3.37
4, Krylon Part #503715, Lawson No. 14565 TOTAL 729.00 1,011.00 NO BID
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36 ea. UNIT
APWA Utility Yellow PRICE 243 3.37
5. Krylon Part #S03801, Lawson No. 14562 TOTAL 87.48 121.32 NO BID
96 ea. UNIT
APWA Orange PRICE 243 3.37
6. Krylon Part #503905, Lawson No. 14549 TOTAL 233.28 323.52 NO BID
SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1a TOTAL 52,079.76 72,225.84 NO BID
Price List Catalog Number 2019
Discount Off Price List (%) 20%
Multiplier for Discount .80
Effective Date of Price List 1/1/19
GROUP 1B[INTERIOR/EXTERIOR INDUSTRIAL MAINTENANCE
PAINTS, Spray Paint, Fast Drying
3. 16-0z. cans (12 0z net wt.)
450 ea. UNIT
Gloss Black PRICE 4.80 3.89
1. Krylon Part #K01601, Lawson No. 14555 TOTAL 2,160.00 1,750.50 NO BID
300 ea. UNIT
Gloss White PRICE 4.80 3.89
2. Krylon Part #K01501, Lawson No. 14556 TOTAL 1,440.00 1,167.00 NO BID
300 ea. UNIT
Regal Blue PRICE 4.80 3.89
3. Krylon Part #K01901, Lawson No. 14558 TOTAL 1,440.00 1,167.00 NO BID
SUB TOTAL FOR GOUP 1B TOTAL 5,040.00 4,084.50 NO BID
Price List Catalog Number 2019
Discount Off Price List (%) 20%
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GROUP 1C|TOUGH COAT ACRYLIC ALKYD ENAMELS
Spray Paint, Fast Drying
16 0z. cans (12 oz. Net wt.)
48 ea. UNIT
OSHA Purple PRICE 4.05 3.89
1. Krylon Part #501580, Lawson No. 14561 TOTAL 194.40 186.72 NO BID
240 ea. UNIT
Primer Red PRICE 4.09 3.89
2. Rust-0-leum Part #v2169838, Lawson No. 15020 TOTAL 981.60 933.60 NO BID
SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1C TOTAL 1,176.00 1,120.32 NO BID
Price List Catalog Number 2019
Discount Off Price List (%) 20%
Multiplier for Discount .80
Effective Date of Price List 1/1/19
GROUP 1D|FARM & IMPLEMENT PAINTS
Spray Paint, Fast Drying
16 0z. cans (12 oz. Net wt.)
60 ea. UNIT
John Deere/Green PRICE 4.69 5.77
1. Krylon Part #K01817, Lawson No. 14557 TOTAL 281.40 346.20 NO BID
48 ea. UNIT
School Bus Yellow PRICE 4.69 3.89
2. Krylon Part #K01809, Lawson No. 14563 TOTAL 225.12 186.72 NO BID
SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1D TOTAL 506.52 532.92 NO BID
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GROUP 1E(METALLIC PAINTS
Spray Paint, Fast Drying
16 0z. cans (11 oz. Net wt.)
500 ea. UNIT
Bright Silver PRICE 4.69 3.34
1. Krylon Part #K01401, Lawson No. 14553 TOTAL 2,345.00 1,670.00 NO BID
SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1E TOTAL 2,345.00 1,670.00 NO BID
Price List Catalog Number 2019
Discount Off Price List (%) 20%
Multiplier for Discount .80
Effective Date of Price List 1/1/19
GROUP 1F|WAND
100 ea. UNIT
Marking/Stripping Wand PRICE 19.68 23.08
1. Krylon Part No. K7096, Lawson No. 16134 TOTAL 1,968.00 2,308.00 NO BID
SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1F TOTAL 1,968.00 2,308.00 NO BID
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GRAND TOTAL (GROUPS 1A-1F) TOTAL 67,195.58 85,325.88] NOBID
EXTENSION 1 67,195.58
EXTENSION 2 67,195.58
EXTENSION 3 67,195.58
Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days 7-10 days 2-3 days

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

AlW

Bay Tech Supply
Busschase
Ferguson

JP Painting

MSC Direct

My Parts Plus
Pintura Paint Store

Pyramid School Products
Roberts Painting

Safety Supply
Saf-T-Glove

Sherwin Williams
Sunbelt Mill Supply
Wesco

Demandstar
SAWS Website




